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February 18, 2011 
 
TO:  Commissioners and Interested Parties 
 
FROM:  Peter Douglas, Executive Director 

Charles Lester, Senior Deputy Director 
  Ruby Pap, North Central Coast District Supervisor 
  Renée T. Ananda, North Central Coast District, Program Analyst 
 
SUBJECT: City of Half Moon Bay LCP Amendment No. HMB-MAJ-2-10-A (IDES 

Rezone) for Public Hearing and Action at the California Coastal 
Commission’s March 11, 2011 meeting to take place in Santa Cruz. 

____________________________________________________________________________ 
 

SYNOPSIS 
 

This Local Coastal Program (LCP) amendment request from the City of Half Moon City 
proposes changes to the land use and zoning designations for a 0.44-acre portion of a 0.86-
acre parcel located at 745 Main Street in Half Moon Bay, San Mateo County, that is currently 
split-zoned residential and commercial.  The land use designation would change from 
residential medium density (RM) to Commercial-General (C-G) and the zoning would change 
from Single-family Residential (R-1-B-2) to Commercial-Downtown (C-D). The purpose of the 
amendment is to establish a uniform commercial land use designation and corresponding 
zoning for the entire parcel so that the current use of the site as a cultural society facility would 
conform to the standards for the Commercial-General land use designations and Commercial–
Downtown zoning. 
 
Staff recommends that the Commission certify the LCP amendment request as submitted.  If 
the Commission does not adopt any suggested modifications the LCP amendment would be 
effective upon Commission action. 
 
1. BACKGROUND 
 
The subject property is owned by Irmandade do Divino Espiritu Santo (IDES), a Portuguese 
cultural society/organization, and is located at 745 Main Street, and abuts the southern limit of 
the City of Half Moon Bay’s Historic Downtown area located east of Highway 1 (Cabrillo 
Highway) (EXHIBITS 1 and 2 ).  The 0.86-acre (37,361 square feet) site is developed with three 
one-story structures (a 4,989-sq.-ft. meeting hall, 4,956-sq.-ft. small hall w/chapel, kitchen, and 
a 6,124-sq.-ft. large hall), and a parking lot. It is used for various community events (dinners, 
celebrations, dances, festivals, parties, and receptions).   The City of Half Moon Bay Planning 
Commission approved a Coastal Development Permit (CDP) and variance on May 2009, 
allowing a 583-sq.-ft addition to the non-residential structure located on the site.  The variance 
for the building addition raised the issue of the existing use’s consistency with the residential 
zoning currently applied to that portion of the property.  As a result, in June 2009 the Planning 
Commission initiated the process to amend the LCP for the residentially-designated portion of 
the site.  Resolution Nos. P-04-10 and C-32-10; and Ordinance No. C-07-10 were passed and 
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adopted for this LUP amendment through the local government process, on March 23, 2010, 
May 4, 2010, and May 18, 2010, respectively.  (EXHIBITS 6, 7, and 8)  The amendment 
application was then transmitted to the Commission August 19, 2010.  
  
2. STANDARD OF REVIEW 
 
Section 30512 of the Coastal Act requires the Commission to certify an LUP amendment if it 
finds that it meets the requirements of, and is in conformity with, the policies of Chapter 3 of the 
Coastal Act. A majority vote of the appointed Commission membership is required.  The 
standard of review for the proposed amendment to the City’s IP is that it must be in conformity 
with and adequate to carry out the policies of the LUP. A majority vote of the Commissioners 
present is required 
  
3. MOTIONS, STAFF RECOMMENDATION, and RESOLUTIONS 
 
A. APPROVAL OF THE LUP AMENDMENT PORTION OF AMENDMENT NO.  HMB-

MAJ-2-10-A (IDES) AS SUBMITTED 
 
MOTION 1: I move that the Commission certify Land Use Plan Amendment No. HMB-MAJ-2-

10-A as submitted by the City of Half Moon Bay. 
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION OF CERTIFICATION AS SUBMITTED: 
 
Staff recommends a YES vote.  Passage of the motion will result in certification of the Land Use 
Plan Amendment as submitted and adoption of the following resolution and findings.  The 
motion passes only by an affirmative vote of a majority of the appointed Commissioners. 
 
RESOLUTION TO CERTIFY THE LAND USE PLAN AMENDMENT: 
 
The Commission hereby certifies the Land Use Plan Amendment No. HMB-MAJ-2-10-A as 
submitted by the City of Half Moon Bay and adopts the findings set forth below on the grounds 
that the amendment is in conformity with the policies of Chapter 3 of the Coastal Act.  
Certification of the Land Use Plan amendment complies with the California Environmental 
Quality Act because either: 1) feasible mitigation measures and/or alternatives have been 
incorporated to substantially lessen any significant adverse effects of the plan on the 
environment; or 2) there are no further feasible alternatives or mitigation measures which could 
substantially lessen any significant adverse impact which the Land Use Plan Amendment may 
have on the environment. 
 
 
B. APPROVAL OF THE IP AMENDMENT PORTION OF AMENDMENT NO. HMB-MAJ-2-

10-A (IDES REZONE) AS SUBMITTED 
 
 
MOTION 2: I move that the Commission reject Implementation Plan Amendment No. 

HMB-MAJ-2-10-A by the City of Half Moon Bay as submitted. 
 
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION OF CERTIFICATION AS SUBMITTED: 
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Staff recommends a NO vote.  Following the staff recommendation will result in certification of 
the Implementation Plan Amendment as submitted and the adoption of the following resolution 
and findings.  The motion passes only by an affirmative vote of a majority of the Commissioners 
present. 
 
RESOLUTION:
 
The Commission hereby certifies the Implementation Plan Amendment No. HMB-MAJ-2-10-A 
for the City of Half Moon Bay as submitted and adopts the findings set forth below on grounds 
that the Implementation Plan as amended, is in conformity with and is adequate to carry out the 
provisions of the Land Use Plan, as amended and certified, and certification of the 
Implementation Plan Amendment will meet the requirements of the California Environmental 
Quality Act, because either: 1) feasible mitigation measures and/or alternatives have been 
incorporated to substantially lessen any significant adverse effects of the Implementation 
Program Amendment on the environment; or 2) there are no further feasible alternatives or 
mitigation measures that would substantially lessen any significant adverse impacts on the 
environment that will result from certification of the Implementation Program Amendment. 
 
4. FINDINGS and DECLARATIONS 
 
The Commission hereby finds and declares as follows: 
 
A.  Amendment Description
 
The proposed LCP amendment would change the land use and zoning designation for a 0.44-
acre portion of a 0.86-acre parcel located at 745 Main Street in Half Moon Bay, San Mateo 
County.  The land use designation would change from residential medium density (RM) to 
Commercial-General (C-G) and the zoning would change from Single-Family Residential (R-1-
B-2) to Commercial-Downtown (C-D).  (EXHIBITS 3 and 4) 
 
B.  Site Description
 
The IDES property is bounded by Main Street on the west, Johnston Street to the east, Correas 
Street on the north, and Filbert Street to the south.  (EXHIBIT 2)  It can be accessed either from 
Main Street or Johnston Street. Development within the surrounding area comprises 
businesses, including small businesses that have been established in converted historic 
houses, and the Coastside County Water District office.  Single-family residences are located on 
the Johnston side of the property (to the east of the site).  Zoning designations directly abutting 
the site are Commercial-Downtown (C-D) to the southwest, west, and northwest, and Single-
family Residential (R-1-B-2) to the southeast, east, and northeast.  
 
The 0.86-acre (37,361 square feet) site is developed with three one-story structures: (1) a 
4,989-sq.-ft. meeting hall; (2) a 4,956-sq.-ft. small hall with chapel, kitchen; and (3) a 6,124-sq.-
ft. large hall; and a parking lot. It is used for various community events (dinners, celebrations, 
dances, festivals, parties, and receptions).   (EXHIBIT 2)  
  
C.  Analysis  
 
Land Use 
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Section 30250(a) of the Coastal Act requires that new development be located in or near 
existing developed areas that are able to accommodate it and where it will not result in 
significant adverse effects, either individually or cumulatively, on coastal resources.  The 
proposed LCP Amendment is located in the already developed downtown area of the City of 
Half Moon Bay. The proposed LCP amendment would result in the entire 0.86-acre IDES 
parcel/site being designated and zoned for Commercial uses, which would match the existing 
use of the site as a club or lodge.  The purpose of the C-D district is to minimize the impact of 
commercial development on adjacent residential areas by providing a transition area of lower 
intensity commercial uses.  The C-D district allows “Club or Lodge” use as a principal, permitted 
use, therefore the current use of the site would be consistent with the commercial land use 
designation and zoning.  The majority of the site along the Main Street side of the parcel is 
already zoned C-D. The proposed LUP amendment would concentrate commercial 
development in an existing developed area, consistent with Coastal Act Section 30250. The 
proposed zoning change is adequate to carry out and conforms to the LUP as amended. 
 
Public Access 
Coastal Act sections 30210 and 30211, and require protection of the public’s right to access the 
coast and the opportunity to use and enjoy the coast for recreation.  The site is located east of 
Highway 1 within its downtown area.  It is not near any coastal area access points, and as 
described above, existing roadways are adequate to circulate traffic in the town without 
impacting public vehicular access to the coast.  The existing use does not limit coastal access 
and recreation opportunities for the public, and any future commercial redevelopment would be 
concentrated in the downtown away from coastal access points. Therefore, the proposed LUP 
Amendment is consistent with Coastal Act Sections 30210 and 30211. The proposed zoning 
change is adequate to carry out and conforms to the LUP as amended.    
 
Environmentally Sensitive Habitat Areas (ESHA) and Wetlands 
Coastal Act Section 30240 requires the protection of environmentally sensitive habitat areas 
against significant disruption of habitat values.  It additionally requires that development 
adjacent to these areas shall be sited and designed to prevent significant adverse impacts. The 
subject site and the surrounding area are developed and there is no ESHA, wetlands, or riparian 
habitat located on or adjacent to the IDES property. Any future commercial redevelopment on 
the property would not result in impacts to ESHA, wetlands, or riparian habitat. Therefore, the 
proposed LUP Amendment is consistent with Coastal Act Sections 30240. The proposed zoning 
change is adequate to carry out and conforms to the LUP as amended.    
 
Hazards 
Coastal Act Section 30253 requires the minimization of adverse impacts and risks to human life.  
The IDES property is located in an existing developed area east of Highway 1 and is not located 
on a site that is susceptible to bluff retreat or landslides. Should future commercial re-
development be considered, it would need to conform to the Certified LCP policies on hazards 
and requirements for commercial development currently applied to the majority of the site.  
Therefore, the proposed LUP Amendment is consistent with Coastal Act Sections 30253. The 
proposed zoning change is adequate to carry out and conforms to the LUP as amended.    
 
Visual Resources 
Coastal Act Section 30251 states in relevant part that the scenic and visual qualities of coastal 
areas shall be considered and protected as a resource of public importance.  Permitted 
development shall be sited and designed to protect views to and along the ocean and scenic 
coastal areas. The IDES site is located in an urban, developed, setting near the Historic 
Downtown area of Half Moon Bay.  The site is adjacent to the “Old Downtown” area as 
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designated on the Certified LUP’s Visual Resources Overlay. (EXHIBIT 5) The commercial land 
use designation, as proposed in this amendment request, would not conflict with the Certified 
LUP policies for Visual Resources or the historic character of the adjacent area.  The IDES site 
is not visible from the coast, nor is it adjacent to, any designated scenic resources.  
Development standards in the C-D zoning district require: a maximum building height of three 
stories, not to exceed 36 feet (three stories); and a minimum site area of 5,000 square feet with 
a 50-foot minimum site width (there are no set back requirements). The three structures on the 
IDES property are all one-story and conform to the regulations.  Any future re-development of 
the property would have to conform to these regulations, and would be compatible with the land 
uses in the surrounding neighborhood.  Therefore, the proposed LUP Amendment is consistent 
with Coastal Act Sections 30251. The proposed zoning change is adequate to carry out and 
conforms to the LUP as amended.    
 
6. CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY ACT (CEQA) 
 
The Coastal Commission’s review and development process for LCPs and amendments to 
them has been designated by the Secretary of Resources as being the functional equivalent of 
the environmental review required by CEQA.  Therefore, local governments are not required to 
undertake an environmental impact analysis on LCP amendments, although the Commission 
can and does use any environmental information that the local government has developed.  The 
City of Half Moon Bay prepared an Initial Study / Negative Declaration for the IDES Rezone 
pursuant to CEQA.  No comments were received on the project.  The City of Half Moon Bay City 
Council issued Resolution N. C-32-10 certifying and adopting the Negative Declaration on May 
4, 2010. 

The Coastal Commission must make a finding that the amendment fully complies with the 
Coastal Act.  It must also make a finding of consistency with Section 21080.5 of the Public 
Resources Code.  Section 21080.5(d)(2)(A) of the Public Resources Code requires that the 
Commission not approve or adopt an LCP: 

…if there are feasible alternatives or feasible mitigation measures available which would 
substantially lessen any significant adverse effects which the activity may have on the 
environment. 

The City’s proposal is consistent with the Coastal Act and the Certified LUP.  It will not result in 
any significant adverse impacts on coastal resources.  The Commission incorporates its findings 
on LUP conformity at this point as if set forth in full.  These findings address and respond to all 
public comments regarding potential significant adverse effects of the project that have been 
received as of the writing of this report.  Therefore, the Commission finds that approval of the 
Zoning Code will not result in significant environmental effects within the meaning of the 
California Environmental Quality Act.   

 
EXHIBITS 
1. Regional Location Map 
2. Vicinity / Aerial Map 
3. Existing and Proposed Zoning Maps 
4. Existing and Proposed Land Use Plan Maps 
5. Visual Resources Overlay Map 
6. City of Half Moon Bay Resolution No. P-04-10 
7. City of Half Moon Bay Resolution No. C-32-10 
8. City of half Moon Bay Ordinance No. C-07-10 
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