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Addendum

 
 
April 6, 2009 
 
To: Commissioners and Interested Persons 
 
From: California Coastal Commission 
 San Diego Staff 
 
Subject: Addendum to Item Wed 11b, Coastal Commission PMP Application  
 PSD-DM-40-09 (Broadway Pier Cruise Ship Terminal), for the 

Commission Meeting of April 8, 2009 
________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Staff recommends the following changes be made to the above-referenced staff report: 
 
The attached "Exhibit #7 Existing Land Uses" and "Exhibit #8 Exhibits to Coastal 
Development Permits" shall be added to the staff report. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
(G:\San Diego\Reports\Port\PMPA #40  PSD-DM-40-09 Brdwy Cruise Ship Term addendum.doc) 
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  W11b             
        March 19, 2009 
 

 
TO: COMMISSIONERS AND INTERESTED PERSONS 
 
FROM: PETER DOUGLAS, EXECUTIVE DIRECTOR 
 
SUBJECT: PORT OF SAN DIEGO DE MINIMIS PORT MASTER PLAN 

AMENDMENT PSD-DM-40-09 (Broadway Pier Cruise Ship Terminal) 
(For Commission review at its meeting of April 8 - 10, 2009) 

 
The Coastal Act was amended January 1, 1995 to provide for a more streamlined method 
to review amendments to port master plans (PMP).  Section 30716(c) allows the 
Executive Director to make a determination that a proposed PMP Amendment is de 
minimis in nature.  The Executive Director must determine that the proposed amendment: 
1) has no impact, either individually or cumulatively, on coastal resources; 2) is 
consistent with the policies of Chapter 3; and 3) does not propose any change in land use 
or water use or any change in the allowable use of property.  Section 30716(c) requires 
the local government to notice the proposed de minimis LCP amendment 21 days prior to 
submitting it to the Executive Director either through: 1) publication in a newspaper of 
general circulation; 2) posting onsite and offsite the area affected by the amendment; or 
3) direct mailing to owners of contiguous property.  If the Executive Director makes the 
determination that the proposed amendment qualifies as a “de minimis” amendment and 
finds the public notice measures have been satisfied, such determination is then reported 
to the Commission for its concurrence. 
 
An Initial Study/Addendum to the North Embarcadero Alliance Visionary Plan Master 
Environmental Impact Report was approved by the Board of Port Commissioners in June 
2007 (Res. 2007-126) for construction of a new cruise ship terminal.  The Port District 
exempted the proposed amendment from review under the California Environmental 
Quality Act (Notice of Exemption dated 12/18/08).  A public hearing on the proposed 
PMP amendment was held and the Board of Port Commissioners adopted the amendment 
on February 3, 2009 as Resolution #2009-37.   
 
The amendment request was received in the Commission office on March 3, 2009, and 
deemed to be de minimis by the Executive Director on March 17, 2009. 
 
1. BACKGROUND/HISTORY 
 
At the Commission meeting of March 14, 2001, the Commission approved the San Diego 
Unified Port District Port Master Plan (PMP) Amendment #27 creating a new "North 
Embarcadero Overlay District" within the existing Waterfront district.  The amendment 
anticipated a number of new projects in the North Embarcadero including the 
redevelopment of Lane Field; the narrowing of Harbor Drive from four lanes to three 
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between Grape Street and Pacific Highway; the extension of B and C Streets between 
Pacific Highway and North Harbor Drive; construction of a new 25-foot wide pedestrian 
esplanade along the water’s edge at Harbor Drive; the replacement of three existing 
industrial piers with one new public pier at Grape Street; construction of a small 
commercial recreation facility on the new Grape Street Pier; construction of a restaurant 
on the bayfront inland of the Grape Street Pier; modernization of the cruise ship terminal 
at the B Street Pier; and docking the U.S.S. Midway Aircraft Carrier for use as a museum 
on the south side of Navy Pier.  
 
With regard to Broadway Pier, the amendment added the following language to the text 
of the Port Master Plan:  
 

A FAR of 2.0 applies to the B Street and Broadway piers… 
 

…Broadway Pier will continue to provide recreational space on its plaza and 
viewing platform, as well as accommodating commercial shipping and 
miscellaneous vessel berthing, including day cruisers.  Improvements to the pier 
will include paving, plantings, lighting, and furniture. 

 
In addition, the following project was added to the project list: 
 

12. NORTH EMBARCADERO REDEVELOPMENT: (a) Visionary Plan public 
improvements, (b) esplanade, (c) street improvements, (d) vista points, (e) Grape 
Street piers replacement + restaurant, (f) park and plaza areas, (g) Broadway Pier 
infrastructure improvements, (h) B and C Street linkages between Pacific 
Highway and North Harbor Drive [Emphasis added]. 

 
The approved amendment allowed for infrastructure improvements, but did not 
specifically identify construction of a new cruise ship terminal.   
 
In June 2007, the Board of Port Commissioners authorized approval of a non-appealable 
coastal development permit (CDP-2007-03) for construction of a new, approximately 
51,500 sq.ft., 38-foot high cruise ship terminal building and associated improvements 
including a ground transportation area, service area, and public viewing area (see Exhibit 
#4).  The Port District does not routinely send a notice of final action to the Commission 
for non-appealable permits.  Thus, after becoming aware of the port permit several 
months later, Commission staff contacted Port staff to express concerns that an 
amendment to the certified Port Master Plan was required before a new cruise ship 
terminal could be approved.  After several months of discussion between Port and 
Commission staff, proposed language was developed to amend the certified PMP to add 
construction of a new terminal with public access and recreation improvements to the 
PMP project list for submittal to the Executive Director as a de minimis amendment. 
 
However, as noted in the proposed PMPA submittal, staff at the Port District have 
continued to assert that the cruise ship terminal project was envisioned by the existing 
certified PMP, and that a PMPA is "technically unnecessary since it is classified as non-
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appealable; the PMP only requires a listing of appealable projects."  The Commission 
does not concur.  Further analysis of this point of contention is warranted because the 
extent of development that must be considered and analyzed as a PMP amendment is 
fundamental to port planning under the Coastal Act. 
 
The Proposed Cruise Ship Terminal is Not Included in the Certified PMP 
 
The existing certified PMP and the record are clear that while cruise berthing is currently 
allowed at Broadway Pier, no new terminal building was envisioned on Broadway Pier 
when the Commission approved the North Embarcadero PMP.  There was no mention of 
a new cruise ship terminal on Broadway Pier in the Master EIR adopted for the North 
Embarcadero Visionary Plan/PMPA.  Thus, an addendum to the EIR was prepared to 
cover this new project.  This clearly demonstrates that the new terminal was not reviewed 
or evaluated in the PMP, as the Plan could not legally have included a project that had not 
undergone environmental review. 
 
Only the projects contained in the "Table 11: Project List" were approved as part of the 
North Embarcadero PMPA.  The purpose of the project list in the Port Master Plan is to 
identify upcoming projects that have received plan-level Commission review and 
approval as consistent in concept with the Coastal Act.  (Coastal permit review is still 
required to implement particular projects).  All future projects must be included on this 
list, with the exception of minor alterations to existing structures or on-going operations 
consistent with the Master Plan.  As noticed above, the only projects on the project list 
for Broadway Pier are "infrastructure improvements" described in the text as including 
"paving, plantings, lighting, and furniture."   
 
Exhibit #5 is a copy of a letter from Port Planning Services Manager William Chopyk 
dated September 25, 2000, responding to Commission staff concerns and questions about 
various aspects of the North Embarcadero PMPA.  Throughout the letter, Mr. Chopyk 
confirms that development “not listed as a project on Table 11…would require a 
subsequent Port Master Plan amendment and additional environmental review” (see 
Items nos. 5, 6, 7, 8, and 9).  For Broadway Landing, the letter specifically states that 
“The project list, Table 11 (DPMPA page 76) describes [the] only Broadway Pier 
infrastructure improvements, i.e., water and sewer lines, electrical improvement, pier 
repairs, etc.,” further confirming that no new buildings were proposed as part of the 
amendment. 
 
Port staff have stated that the sentence in the PMP that an “FAR of 2.0 applies to the B 
Street and Broadway piers” is sufficient indication that construction of a new building on 
Broadway Pier is consistent with the approved Plan.  The Commission respectfully 
disagrees.  Even in the absence of the PMP language and Port correspondence describing 
the limited development contemplated on Broadway Pier, a simple policy statement of 
FAR limits for an area does not constitute approval of substantial new structures or uses 
not reviewed for consistency with the Coastal Act through the PMP certification process.  
Broad policy statements outlining guidelines for future development are entirely 
appropriate in the PMP, but they do not substitute for the required textual descriptions of 
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specific projects.  The proposed project is therefore clearly not included in the certified 
PMP. 
 
The PMP Must Include All Future Projects 
 
The Coastal Act requires that all projects for which the Port exercises its permit issuance 
authority must be included in the PMP.  Section 30715 states in relevant part:  “After a 
port master plan or any portion thereof has been certified, the permit authority of the 
commission … shall no longer be exercised by the commission over any new 
development contained in the certified plan or any portion thereof and shall at that time 
be delegated to the appropriate port governing body …”  (emphasis added).  Thus, the 
commission’s authority is delegated to the Port solely for “new development contained in 
the certified plan.”  If such new development is not contained in the certified plan, the 
Port does not have the authority to approve the project. 
 
This interpretation of Section 30715 is supported by Section 30718, which requires Ports 
to provide the Commission with CEQA documentation for “developments approved by 
the commission in a certified master plan” that are not appealable.   Section 30718 
therefore acknowledges that the Commission must approve, as part of the PMP, the 
actual developments proposed within a port, even if such developments are non-
appealable.  In addition, the Commission’s regulations include a section defining the 
required contents of a master plan for appealable development and procedures for the 
Commission to review such projects if the proposed development is not well defined at 
the time of a port’s submittal.  See 14 CCR §13625(b).  The next section (13625(c)) 
allows the procedures outlined for appealable developments to be used for any other 
proposed developments that are not well defined.  Section 13625(c) would be 
unnecessary if Ports were only required to include appealable developments in their 
PMPs. 
 
The Port argues that because Section 30711(a)(4) specifies that Ports must submit 
additional detailed information related to appealable projects, this means that it need not 
list, or submit to the Commission for review through a PMP Amendment, non-appealable 
projects.  This conclusion cannot be implied from the language of 30711(a)(4), which 
simply explains that ports must include additional information for the Commission to 
review appealable projects.   
 
Furthermore, Section 30711(a) of the Coastal Act states "[a] port master plan shall 
include all of the following: (1) The proposed uses of land and water areas, where 
known."  Section 30711(b) states that "[a] port master plan shall contain information in 
sufficient detail to allow the commission to determine its adequacy and conformity with 
the applicable policies of this division."  Section 30711 therefore requires that all 
proposed uses of land and water areas contain sufficient detail to allow the commission to 
determine its adequacy and conformity with the applicable policies of Chapter 8 of the 
Coastal Act.   
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The certified Port Master Plan itself reflects the fact that all proposed development, 
whether appealable or not, must be included in the plan.  It states "[a] listing of 
development projects, covering both appealable and non-appealable categories, is 
provided in the discussion for each of the nine Planning Districts" (PMP pg.2).  If the 
Port’s interpretation of the Coastal Act were accepted, the Commission would have no 
review authority over non-appealable developments within the Port’s jurisdiction.  As 
described above, this interpretation is inconsistent with the plain language of the Coastal 
Act. 
 
In summary, the record is clear that a new cruise ship terminal was not part of the 
approved Port Master Plan.  All significant development projects must be listed in the 
certified PMP.  Commission review of a PMP amendment or concurrence with the 
Executive Director's determination of de minimis is required for the proposed 
development to proceed.   
 
2. PROPOSED AMENDMENT 
 
The proposed amendment contains the following addition to the existing Port Master Plan 
Table 11 Project List: 
 

4. NORTH EMBARCADERO REDEVELOPMENT: (a) Visionary Plan public 
improvements, (b) esplanade, (c) street improvements, (d) vista points, (e) Grape 
Street piers replacement + restaurant, (f) park and plaza areas, (g) Broadway Pier 
cruise ship terminal (approximately 60,000 sq.ft., maximum 50-foot building 
height) to cover no more than 50 percent of the pier, public events space, 15,000 
sq.ft. public recreation and viewing area, a 25-foot wide public access corridor 
along the southern side of the pier, and infrastructure improvements, (h) B and C 
Street linkages between Pacific Highway and North Harbor Drive. 

 
Broadway Pier is currently designed for “Park/Plaza" and "Marine Terminal" uses, and 
the proposed amendment would not change that land use designation.   
 
The Board of Port Commissioners resolutions that approve and convey the proposed de 
minimis LCP amendment are attached.  The amendment was properly noticed through 
newspaper publication and direct mail.  Several letters of opposition to the project were 
received at the Port level, and these letters are attached as Exhibit #6. 
  
Following is a brief explanation of the purpose for or intent of the change and the reasons 
why it is de minimis pursuant to Section 30514 of the Coastal Act. 
  
DISCUSSION 
 
Broadway Pier has historically been used for commercial docking, public access, and as a 
public viewing and recreational area.  The existing PMP provides for use of the 
Broadway Pier as a cruise ship terminal. The Port uses Broadway Pier as its auxiliary 
cruise berth; "B" Street Pier, with its two berths, is the primary cruise facility.  Broadway 
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Pier is used when "B" Street is full and there is a need for a third berth on the same day.  
In addition, the Broadway Pier facility will be used to allow the Port to undertake the 
seismic pier repairs and facility improvements needed at the existing "B" Street Pier. 
 
Since the terrorist attacks of September 11, 2001, public access to the Broadway Pier has 
been restricted when cruise ships are present.  The Port District has indicated that in 
2006, Broadway Pier was closed for a total 58 days for cruise ships, military vessels and 
educational/research vessels. Cruise ship traffic in San Diego has increased significantly 
in the last decade, and Broadway Pier is likely to continue to be used more frequently as 
an auxiliary terminal. 
 
Section 30708 of Chapter 8 of the Coastal Act states "All port related developments shall 
be located, designed, and constructed so as to: (a) Minimize substantial adverse 
environmental impacts."  The construction of a new permanent building on the pier could 
potentially impact public views, access and recreational opportunities.  The importance of 
the open nature of the pier is specifically referenced in the USS Midway Mitigation and 
Monitoring Program, (North Embarcadero Final EIR, Section 4, Page 4-12) which states 
“[t]he significant visual impact on views from the G Street Mole would be offset and 
mitigated by the similar nearby public views available from the Broadway Pier.”   
 
However, the proposed PMPA, and the project, have been designed with public access 
corridors and operational features to ensure impacts to coastal resources are avoided.  The 
site is currently and will continue to be used as an auxiliary terminal, a long-established 
visitor-serving use appropriate for a downtown pier located adjacent to the existing main 
terminal.  There have been several small buildings on the pier for many years, (some of 
which have recently been demolished) so public views from the pier have never been 
entirely unobstructed.  While the proposed terminal will be considerably larger than the 
existing structures, the amendment includes specific parameters to which the 
development must conform, including a limit on the building size, height, and pier 
coverage.  A public access corridor on the south side of the building, no less than 25-feet 
in width, must be provided, along with a 15,000 sq.ft. public recreation and viewing area 
and public events space. 
 
With regard to traffic, as described in the EIR addendum for the terminal, the new 
building is not expected to result in a direct increase in cruise ship activities, but would 
rather increase the efficiency of passenger embarkation and disembarkation, improve 
access to various ground transportation opportunities, and provide an improved aesthetic 
experience for the general public.  The project is expected to improve traffic flow and 
circulation along Harbor Drive in the vicinity of the Broadway Pier, since providing 
additional designated parking areas for these vehicles on the pier should reduce the 
potential stacking of busses, taxis and shuttle vehicles.  
 
Several letters of objections to the proposed PMPA received by the Port (see Exhibit #6) 
note that construction of a large terminal on Broadway Pier is inconsistent with the vision 
of the North Embarcadero Visionary Plan (NEVP) adopted by the Port.  The NEVP 
illustrations show Broadway Pier as mostly open for public access.  The general 
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description in the NEVP is that a “small structure, up to 1,500 square feet in site area, 
[that] may be constructed to service visiting ships…At the base of the pier, food and craft 
kiosks line a small commercial area.  The central portion of the pier is left clear to 
accommodate temporary and changing events" (NEVP pg. 57 & 97-98). 
 
However, while some specific recommendations of the Visionary Plan were adopted as 
part of the PMP in Amendment #27, the entirety of the Visionary Plan’s body of 
recommendations are identified as guidance only for the Port in implementing the PMP.  
The Visionary Plan is a conceptual-level, illustrative planning document with a number 
of different project scenarios identified for the area.  The Visionary Plan itself has not 
been incorporated into the Port Master Plan and is not the standard of review for coastal 
development permits issued by the Port District.   
 
Thus, as proposed, the proposed amendment would allow for construction of a new 
permanent cruise ship terminal, a high-priority use under the Coastal Act, while ensuring 
that public access and recreation functions continue to be available on the dock when 
cruise ships are not present.  The amendment does not consist of any changes in land or 
water use, or any change in the allowable use of property.  The dock will continue to 
function as a commercial/industrial use with public access, views and recreation 
available.  The proposed building has been designed to protect and preserve public access 
to the shoreline.  Therefore, as proposed, the amendment does not have any impact, either 
individually or cumulatively, on coastal resources.  All the proposed de minimis 
modifications are consistent with the public access and recreation policies and section 
30252 of the Act. 
 
CONSISTENCY WITH THE CALIFORNIA ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 
ACT (CEQA)
 
The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires less environmentally 
damaging alternatives to proposed projects to be considered and the imposition of 
mitigation measures to lessen significant adverse effects that may result from proposals.  
For the reasons discussed in this report, the proposed project has no significant adverse 
environmental effects within the meaning of the California Environmental Quality Act. 
 
DETERMINATION 
 
The Executive Director determines that the Port of San Diego PMP amendment is de 
minimis.  Based on the information submitted by the Port, the proposed PMP amendment 
will have no impact, either individually or cumulatively, on coastal resources.  It is 
consistent with the policies of Chapter 3 of the Coastal Act.  The amendment does not 
propose any change in land use or any change in the allowable use of property.  The Port 
has properly noticed the proposed amendment.  As such, the amendment is de minimis 
pursuant to Section 30716(c). 
 
MOTION: I move that the Commission concur with the Executive Director’s 

determination that the PMP amendment, as submitted, is de minimis. 
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STAFF RECOMMENDATION: 
 
The Executive Director recommends that the Commission concur in this determination.  
Unless three or more members of the Commission object to this determination, the 
amendment shall become effective and part of the certified PMP ten (10) days after the 
date of the Commission meeting. 
   
 
 
 
 
(G:\San Diego\Reports\Port\PMPA #40  PSD-DM-40-09 Brdwy Cruise Ship Term stfrpt.doc) 
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